
Bidder’s Name Standard Weight Concrete 
Blocks 

Retaining Wall Block – 6”x16”x12” Retaining Wall Block – 8”x18”x12” 

Conway Block $1.45 $5.36 $5.50 

Bid Winner: Concrete Blocks 

Bid Tabulations were approved by City Council on December 22nd, 2015 

For additional information regarding this bid; please contact Finley Vinson @ finley.vinson@cityofconway.org or 501.450.6165. 

Bid Number: 2016-02 – Annual Bid_Concrete Block 

Bid Opening Date: Tuesday, December 15th, 2015 

City of Conway, Arkansas 
Mayor’s Office  
1201 Oak Street 
Conway, AR 72032 
501.450.6110 

Number of Bids Received - 1 
Opened by: Ronnie Hall 

Office of the Mayor 
City of Conway 

Bid Tabulation Sheet  
www.cityofconway.org 

mailto:finley.vinson@cityofconway.org
http://www.cityofconway.org/


City of Conway 

Office of tlie <M_ayor 
9vtayor cra6 crownse[[ 
WWW. cityo{conway. ora 

INVITATION 

TO THE VENDOR ADDRESSED: 

Bidders are invited to furnish the items listed herein in accordance with the terms and conditions 
attached. Sealed bids must be in the Office of the Mayor; no later than lO:OOam, Tuesday, December 
15111 , 2015 at which t ime all bids will be opened and read in the Downstairs Conference Room in City 
Hall. Successful bidders will receive purchase order, within 30 days after City Council approval, if 
necessary. Unsigned bids will be rejected. 

Invitation to Bid No. 2016-02 
Concrete Block Annual Bid 

Concrete Block to be used during the 2016 Calendar Year 

Approximately 7,000 Standard Concrete Blocks, 8x8x 16 to be used during 2016. 

per each 

Approximately 500 Retaining Wall Block (6"x I 6"x 12") with interlock for connecting geotextile fabric 
equal to Versa-Lok Blocks to be used during 2016. Blocks are to be gray. 

,- 3 t:, 
per each $ 0 ~ ~ 

Approximately 2000 Retaining Wall Block (8"x I 8x 12") with interlock for connecting geotextile fabric 
equal to Rockwood Blocks to be used during 2016. Blocks are to be gray. 

h $ 
.r-, ~ 

per eac D ' 

Delivery to be made upon request by City Engineer, Finley Vinson or by other departments as 
requested. 

Additional Information: 

• The bidder shall include all charges, including taxes, fees, freight charges, shipping, etc. (if 
applicable) 

• The bidder needs to include an anticipated delivery date (if applicable) 
• In submitting this bid, it is understood by the undersigned bidder that the right is reserved by 

the City of Conway to reject any and all bids: 
• Contact Information: Finley Vinson, Street Engineer I finley.vinson@cityofconway.org/ 501-

450-6165. 

City Hall 1201 Oak Street, Conway, AR 72034 501.450.6110 



City of Conway 
Concrete Block Annual Bid 

Bid Number: 2016-02 

Bid Opening Date: Tuesday, December 15th, 2015 

City Hall, Downstairs Conference Room @ I O:OOam 

Authorized Agent Bidding on this project: 

Company Name 

Street Address 

City 
ConuJ°':j 

State Zip 

Date 

5 0 I - L/ 7 0 _., / :J. 7 () .So I- t-/ 70 -952! 
' Telephone Number Fax Number 

0 Email Addr€:s 
com 

Unsigned bids will be rejected: 

City Hall 1201 Oak Street, Conway, AR 72034 501.450.6110 



CITY OF CONWAY

SUMMARY OF ANNUAL BIDS FOR STREET DEPARTMENT TYPE WORK

FOR YEAR 2016

Bids Opened December 15, 2015  

GRAVEL ROGERS GROUP          WEBCO Hamilton Aggregates 2015 LOW BID

CRUSHED STONE FOB PLANT $8.56 /TON (Gbr) $7.56 /TON(El Paso) $8.65 /TON $8.05 /TON 
CRUSHED STONE DELIVERED TO STREET DEPT. $13.10 /TON $13.10 /TON $13.33 /TON $12.57 /TON
BALLAST STONE DELIVERED TO STREET DEPT. $13.64 /TON $13.75 /TON $14.41 /TON $13.75 /TON
STONE BACKFILL DELIVERED TO STREET DEPT. $13.39 /TON $12.99 /TON $13.33 /TON $12.99 /TON
RIPRAP DELIVERED TO STREET DEPARTMENT $20.60 /TON $18.62 /TON 20.95$       /TON 18.62$    /TON

CONCRETE       MALLARD        ARGOS 2015 LOW BID  

CLASS A CONCRETE $92.55 /C.Y. $93.52 /C.Y. $84.43 /C.Y.
CLASS S CONCRETE $99.05 /C.Y. $100.05 /C.Y. $87.00 /C.Y.
1% ADDED CALCIUM $4.00 /C.Y. $5.25 /C.Y. $4.00 /C.Y.

 

CONCRETE PIPE: SIZE        Scurlock Forterra Pipe & Precast Drainage Pipe, LLC       2015 LOW BID

12" $8.30 /FOOT $9.90 /FOOT $10.67 /FOOT $8.15 /FOOT
15" $11.00 /FOOT $12.10 /FOOT $13.20 /FOOT $11.35 /FOOT
18" $11.50 /FOOT $14.70 /FOOT $16.00 /FOOT $13.16 /FOOT
24" $18.75 /FOOT $23.30 /FOOT $23.10 /FOOT $19.25 /FOOT
30" $27.00 /FOOT $3.50 /FOOT $34.20 /FOOT $27.82 /FOOT
36" $37.80 /FOOT $47.55 /FOOT $51.70 /FOOT $42.55 /FOOT
42" $53.90 /FOOT $59.30 /FOOT $65.00 /FOOT $53.89 /FOOT
48" $61.50 /FOOT $75.25 /FOOT $79.20 /FOOT $64.96 /FOOT
15" Arch No Bid /FOOT $23.50 /FOOT $36.00 /FOOT No Bid /FOOT
18" Arch $18.00 /FOOT $26.90 /FOOT $31.00 /FOOT No Bid /FOOT
24"Arch $27.00 /FOOT $37.55 /FOOT $35.00 /FOOT No Bid /FOOT
30" Arch $39.00 /FOOT $45.10 /FOOT $46.75 /FOOT No Bid /FOOT
36" Arch $56.50 /FOOT $61.90 /FOOT $64.00 /FOOT No Bid /FOOT
42" Arch $73.60 /FOOT $83.50 /FOOT $84.90 /FOOT No Bid /FOOT
48" Arch $90.50 /FOOT $106.30 /FOOT $103.00 /FOOT No Bid /FOOT

CONCRETE BLOCKS: Conway Block       2015 LOW BID

STANDARD WEIGHT CONCRETE BLOCKS (8"x8"x16") $1.45  /EA. $1.57  /EA.
RETAINING WALL BLOCKS(6"x16"x12") $5.36  /EA. $5.72  /EA.
RETAINING WALL BLOCKS(8"x18"x12") $5.50  /EA. $5.84  /EA.

CONCRETE WORK (MATERIALS FURNISHED BY CITY):

WK Contractors LASKER BROTHERS 2015 LOW BID
4" High x 2' Wide ROLL CURB & GUTTER $4.95 /FOOT $5.50 /FOOT $4.45 /FOOT
6"High  x 1.5' Wide UPRIGHT CURB & GUTTER $4.95 /FOOT $6.00 /FOOT $4.95 /FOOT
6"High  x 2' Wide UPRIGHT CURB & GUTTER $4.95 /S.F. $6.00 /S.F. $1.25 /S.F.
FORM POUR AND FINISH SIDEWALK $1.50 /S.F. $1.25 /S.F. No Bid /S.F.
CONCRETE PAVEMENT REPAIR $10.00 / S.Y. No Bid / S.Y. NO BID / S.Y.
REMOVAL OF UNSUITABLE SUBGRADE $6.00  /C.Y. NO BID  /C.Y. NO BID  /C.Y.
PLACE AND SHAPE STONE BACKFILL $6.50  /C.Y. NO BID  /C.Y. NO BID  /C.Y.

PAVEMENT MARKING

Ark. Line Marking Time Striping
4" White Refl. Paint $0.50 /FOOT $0.20 /FOOT
4" Yellow Refl. Paint $0.50 /FOOT $0.20 /FOOT
6" White Refl. Paint $0.50 /FOOT $0.65 /FOOT
6" Yellow Refl. Paint $0.50 /FOOT $0.65 /FOOT
Min. Charge per Project $2,500.00 /Project $6,000.00 /Project

GASOLINE & DIESEL

REG. UNLEADED GAS - No Ethanol Coulson Oil Heritage Petroleum, LLC M.M. SATTERFIELD OIL Retif Oil & Fuel 2015 LOW BID
               Posted Price 12-14-15 $1.5598  /GAL. $2.0409  /GAL. $1.6437  /GAL. $1.6624  /GAL. $1.9503
               BID AMOUNT FOR DELIVERY $0.1150  /GAL. $0.1199  /GAL. $0.1250  /GAL. $0.2500  /GAL. $0.0625
               TOTAL BASED ON 12-14-15 Posted $1.6748  /GAL. $2.1608  /GAL. $1.7687  /GAL. $1.9124  /GAL. $2.0128
REG. UNLEADED GAS - 10% Max.Ethanol
               Posted Price 12-14-15 $1.2287  /GAL. $1.3248  /GAL. $1.3229  /GAL. $1.3097  /GAL. $1.7532
               BID AMOUNT FOR DELIVERY $0.1150  /GAL. $0.1199  /GAL. $0.1250  /GAL. $0.2500  /GAL. $0.0625
               TOTAL BASED ON 12-14-15 Posted $1.3437  /GAL. $1.4487  /GAL. $1.4479  /GAL. $1.5597  /GAL. $1.8157
Diesel - 5% Max BioDiesel
               Posted Price 12-14-15 $1.0800  /GAL. $1.1979  /GAL. $1.1105  /GAL. $1.1941  /GAL. $2.1461
               BID AMOUNT FOR DELIVERY $0.1150  /GAL. $0.1199  /GAL. $0.1250  /GAL. $0.2500  /GAL. $0.0650
               TOTAL BASED ON 12-14-15 Posted $1.1950  /GAL. $1.3178  /GAL. $1.2355  /GAL. $1.4441  /GAL. $2.2111

frogers
Highlight


