

City of Conway, Arkansas Mayor's Office 1201 Oak Street Conway, AR 72032 501.450.6110

# Office of the Mayor City of Conway Bid Tabulation Sheet

www.cityofconway.org

Number of Bids Received - 2

Opened by: Ronnie Hall

Bid Number: 2016-05 - Annual Bid Ready Mix (Delivered) Concrete

Bid Opening Date: Tuesday, December 15th, 2015

Bidder's Name	Class A Concrete	Class S Concrete	1% Calcium
Mallard	\$92.55	\$99.05	\$4.00
Argo's	\$93.52	\$100.05	\$5.25

Bid Winner: Mallard

Bid Tabulations were approved by City Council on Tuesday, December 22<sup>nd</sup>, 2015.

For additional information regarding this bid; please contact Finley Vinson @ finley.vinson@cityofconway.org or 501.450.6165.

#### **CITY OF CONWAY**

# SUMMARY OF ANNUAL BIDS FOR STREET DEPARTMENT TYPE WORK

#### **FOR YEAR 2016**

Bids Opened December 15, 2015

Bids Opened December 15, 2015											
GRAVEL		ROGERS	GROUP	WEBCC	)	Hamilto	n Aac	gregates	2015 LOW	/ BID	
CRUSHED STONE FOB PLANT			/TON (Gbr)		/TON(El Paso			/TON	\$8.05		
	CRUSHED STONE PODPEANT  CRUSHED STONE DELIVERED TO STREET DEPT.		/TON	\$13.10	•			/TON	\$12.57		
BALLAST STONE DELIVERED TO STRE	ET DEPT.	\$13.64	/TON	\$13.75	/TON	\$1	4.41	/TON	\$13.75	/TON	
STONE BACKFILL DELIVERED TO STR	EET DEPT.	\$13.39		\$12.99	/TON			/TON	\$12.99		
RIPRAP DELIVERED TO STREET DEPA	RTMENT	\$20.60	/TON	\$18.62	/TON	\$ 2	0.95	/TON	\$ 18.62	/TON	
CONCRETE		MALLA	RD	ARGOS		2015 L0	OW B	SID)			
CLASS A CONCRETE		\$92.55	/C.Y.	\$93.52	/C.Y.			/C.Y.			
CLASS S CONCRETE		\$99.05	/C.Y.	\$100.05	/C.Y.	\$8	7.00	/C.Y.			
1% ADDED CALCIUM		\$4.00	/C.Y.	\$5.25	/C.Y.	\$	4.00	/C.Y.			
CONCRETE PIPE:	SIZE	Scurlo	ck	Forterra Pipe	& Precast	Drainag	ge Pip	e, LLC	2015 L	OW BID	
	12"	\$8.30	/FOOT	\$9.90	/FOOT	\$1	0.67	/FOOT	\$8.15	/FOOT	
	15"	\$11.00	/FOOT	\$12.10	/FOOT	\$1	3.20	/FOOT	\$11.35	/FOOT	
	18"	\$11.50	/FOOT	\$14.70	/FOOT	\$1	6.00	/FOOT	\$13.16	/FOOT	
	24"		/FOOT		/FOOT			/FOOT	\$19.25		
	30"		/FOOT		/FOOT			/FOOT	\$27.82		
	36" 42"		/FOOT /FOOT		/FOOT /FOOT			/FOOT /FOOT	\$42.55 \$53.89		
	42 48"		/FOOT		/FOOT			/FOOT	\$64.96		
	15" Arch	No Bid	/FOOT		/FOOT			/FOOT	No Bid	/FOOT	
	18" Arch		/FOOT		/FOOT			/FOOT	No Bid	/FOOT	
	24"Arch		/FOOT		/FOOT			/FOOT	No Bid	/FOOT	
	30" Arch	\$39.00	/FOOT	\$45.10	/FOOT	\$4	6.75	/FOOT	No Bid	/FOOT	
	36" Arch		/FOOT		/FOOT			/FOOT	No Bid	/FOOT	
	42" Arch		/FOOT		/FOOT			/FOOT	No Bid	/FOOT	
	48" Arch	\$90.50	/FOOT	\$106.30	/F001	\$10	13.00	/FOOT	No Bid	/FOOT	
CONCRETE BLOCKS:				Conway Block	(	201	5 LO\	W BID			
STANDARD WEIGHT CONCRETE BLOC	CKS (8"x8"x16")			\$1.45				/EA.			
RETAINING WALL BLOCKS(6"x16"x12")				\$5.36				/EA.			
RETAINING WALL BLOCKS(8"x18"x12")				\$5.50	/EA.	\$	5.84	/EA.			
CONCRETE WORK (MATERIALS FU	JRNISHED I	BY CITY):									
		WK Contra		LASKER BRO		2015 L					
4" High x 2' Wide ROLL CURB & GUTTE			/FOOT		/FOOT			/FOOT			
6"High x 1.5' Wide UPRIGHT CURB & G 6"High x 2' Wide UPRIGHT CURB & GU		\$4.95 \$4.95	/FOOT	\$6.00 \$6.00	/FOOT			/FOOT /S.F.			
FORM POUR AND FINISH SIDEWALK	IIEK	\$ <b>4.93</b> \$1.50		\$1.25		پ No Bid		/S.F.			
CONCRETE PAVEMENT REPAIR		\$10.00		No Bid	/ S.Y.	NO BID		/ S.Y.			
REMOVAL OF UNSUITABLE SUBGRAD	E		/C.Y.	NO BID	/C.Y.	NO BID		/C.Y.			
PLACE AND SHAPE STONE BACKFILL		\$6.50	/C.Y.	NO BID	/C.Y.	NO BID	)	/C.Y.			
PAVEMENT MARKING											
		Ark. Line M	larking	Time Striping							
4" White Refl. Paint			/FOOT		/FOOT						
4" Yellow Refl. Paint			/FOOT		/FOOT						
6" White Refl. Paint 6" Yellow Refl. Paint			/FOOT /FOOT		/FOOT /FOOT						
Min. Charge per Project		\$2,500.00		\$6,000.00							
GASOLINE & DIESEL											
REG. UNLEADED GAS - No Ethanol		Coulson Oi	ı	Heritage Petro	oleum II.C	ммѕ	ATTE	RFIELD OIL	Retif Oil &	Fuel	2015 LOW E
Posted Price 12-14-15		\$1.5598		\$2.0409				/GAL.	\$1.6624		\$1.9503
BID AMOUNT FOR DELIVERY		\$0.1150		\$0.1199				/GAL.	\$0.2500		\$0.0625
TOTAL BASED ON 12-14-15 Po		\$1.6748	/GAL.	\$2.1608	/GAL.	\$1.7	7687	/GAL.	\$1.9124	/GAL.	\$2.0128
REG. UNLEADED GAS - 10% Max.Ethan	iol	<b>.</b>									<b></b>
Posted Price 12-14-15		\$1.2287		\$1.3248				/GAL.	\$1.3097		\$1.7532
BID AMOUNT FOR DELIVERY TOTAL BASED ON 12-14-15 Po	etod	<b>\$0.1150</b> \$1.3437		\$0.1199 \$1.4487				/GAL. /GAL.	\$0.2500 \$1.5597		\$0.0625 \$1.8157
Diesel - 5% Max BioDiesel	งอเซน	φ1.3437	/GAL.	φ1. <del>44</del> 6/	/GAL.	<b>Φ1.</b> 4	+419	/GAL.	φ1.559/	/GAL.	\$1.8157
Posted Price 12-14-15											
		\$1.0800	/GAL.	\$1.1979	/GAL.	\$1.1	1105	/GAL.	\$1.1941	/GAL.	\$2.1461
BID AMOUNT FOR DELIVERY		\$1.0800 <b>\$0.1150</b>		\$1.1979 \$0.1199				/GAL. /GAL.	\$1.1941 \$0.2500		\$2.1461 \$0.0650
	osted		/GAL.		/GAL.	\$0.	1250			/GAL.	



#### City of Conway - Concrete Work Annual Bid

Bid Number: 2016-05

Bid Opening Date: Tuesday, December 15<sup>th</sup>, 2015

City Hall, Downstairs Conference Room @ 10:00am

## <u>Bid Submittal:</u> <u>Please submit mix design with bid, with and without air entrainment</u>

Class A Concrete (5.5 sacks - 3,000 psi @ 28 days)	per cubic yard $$92.55$
Class S Concrete (6.5 sacks - 3,500 psi @ 28 days)	per cubic yard \$
Price of 1% Calcium added	per cubic yard \$
Authorized Agent Bidding on this project:	
MALLARD Ready	Mix
Compa	any Name
Dicky Shawow Company Repr	resentative Name
Representative's Signature	12-14-15 Date
POBOK 10 526 Address	dicky charry @ y4hoo. Com Email Address
Conway Ar City State	72 <i>03</i> 2 Zip
501 505-0100 Telephone Number	501 505 0503 Fax Number

Unsigned bids will be rejected:



# MIX DESIGNS

"CLASS A NO AIR "-	CEMENT440 LBS.
	FLYASH78 LBS.
	WATER298 LBS.
	ROCK1971
	SAND1154
"CLASS A WITH AIR "-	CEMENT440 LBS.
CLASS A WITH AIR	
	FLYASH76 LBS.
	WATER298 LBS.
	ROCK1850 LBS.
	SAND1115 LBS.
	MBVR(AIR)5 OZ.
" CLASS S NO AIR " -	CEMENT489 LBS.
	FLYASH122 LBS.
	WATER311 LBS.
	ROCK1890 LBS.
	SAND1115 LBS.
"CLASS S WITH AIR "-	CEMENT489 LBS.
CLASS S WITH AIR	FLYASH122 LBS.
	WATER283 LBS.
	ROCK1810 LBS.
	SAND1115 LBS.
	MBVR(AIR)7.5 OZ
SPECIFIC GRAVITY OF MA	TERIALS: CEMENT- 3.15
	FLYASH- 2.65
	WATER—1
	ROCK2.62
	SAND2.61



# City of Conway – Concrete Work Annual Bid

Bid Number: 2016-05

Bid Opening Date: Tuesday, December 15<sup>th</sup>, 2015

City Hall, Downstairs Conference Room @ 10:00am

## <u>Bid Submittal:</u> <u>Please submit mix design with bid, with and without air entrainment</u>

Class A Concrete (5.5 sacks - 3,000 psi @	28 days)	per cubic yard \$ _	93.52	-	
Class S Concrete (6.5 sacks - 3,500 psi @	28 days)	per cubic yard \$ _	100.05	-	
Price of 1% Calcium added		per cubic yard \$ _	5. 25		
Authorized Agent Bidding on thi	s project:				
	Argos				
	Comp	any Name			
	Bryan A	resentative Name			
	Company Rep	resentative Name			
P //	7			12 111 17	
Representative's Signature				12-14-15 Date	
Represer dative's Signature				Date	
350 South Amity	Rd	×	bfox a	argos-us.com	
Address			Email Addres	SS	
<u>Conway</u> City	AR		72032		
City	State			Zip	
501-960 - 4672			<i>5</i> 01-3.	29 - 2456	
Telephone Number			Fax Nun	nber	

Unsigned bids will be rejected: